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I-84 Westbound 

(from Troutdale) 
Take I-84 W/US-30 W to exit 9 (on a 
left fork). Take exit 9 to merge onto I
-205 S/Veterans Mem Hwy toward 
Salem. Now, follow directions for I-

205 Southbound. 
 

I-205 Southbound 
(from the Airport/PDX) 

Take I-205 South to exit 19 for Divi-
sion St/Powell Blvd/US-26. Keep left 
at the fork and choose the right lane 
(it will allow you to turn left). Turn 
left onto Division St. E at the light. 
Take a right onto SE 98th Ave (just 
pass the Northbound off-ramp). Take 
an immediate left into parking. 
 

I-205 Northbound 
(from Oregon City) 

Take I-205 North to exit 19 for Divi-
sion St/Powell Blvd/US-26 E and get 
into right lane. Go straight at the 
light (Powell Blvd), follow over the 
top of the hill to Division St. and 
Turn right at SE Division St (east). 
Take an immediate right onto SE 
98th Ave. Take an immediate left 
into parking. 
 

Division St. Westbound 
(from Gresham) 

Take Division St. West approx. 6 
miles to SE 98th Ave. Turn left onto 
SE 98th Ave. Take an immediate left 
into parking. 

To Gresham To Portland 


